WHEREAS,

Republic of the Philippines
Department of Science and Technology
SCIENCE AND TECHNOLOGY INFORMATION INSTITUTE

BAC Resolution for the Awarding of the Project,
“Procurement of Various ICT Equipment”
(MITHI)
Resolution No. 2017-059

the SCIENCE AND TECHNOLOGY INFORMATION

INSTITUTE

advertised the Request for Quotation (RFQ) under 53.9 (Negotiated Procurement —
Small Value Procurement) of R.A. 9184 for the project, “Procurement of Various

ICT Equipment” at the PhilGEPS website for three (3) days;

WHEREAS, in response to the said advertisement, five (5) bidders submitted their
quotations;

WHEREAS, the quotations that complied with the Technical Specification were the

following:
ITEMS
JPRODUCT BID AMOUNT OF THE SUPPLIER
KOBS
iEquity Acxesspoint 16/35mm Customers
°°(':';';'1'::f'e Technologies, | ITSolutions, | Production First
Corporation inc. Supply Trading
Inc.
1 unit
Laptop, Core | Php 34,500.00 | Php 39,880.00 | Php 35,049.00 | Php 37,000.00 No bid
i5 or higher
1 unit
i7 or higher :
4 units No bid 235,200.00 : :
Desktop No bid 184,000.00 No bid
1 unit LCD
Projector 31,185.00 23,680.00 No bid 29,000.00 | 34,988.88
i 43,295.00 800.00
Document 293. 48,800. No bid 39,800.00 No bid
Scanner
2 units 55” _
UHD 4K Flat No bid 210,600.00 No bid No bid | 123.777.76
Smart
Monitor
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Republic of the Philippines

Department of Science and Technology
SCIENCE AND TECHNOLOGY INFORMATION INSTITUTE

10 units

Security IP No bid 34,000.00

Camera

No bid No bid No bid

WHEREAS, the TWG recommended the awarding of the following items to iEquity
Corp.: 1 unit Core i7 laptop, 4 units desktop, 1 unit LCD projector, 2 units 55" Flat
Smart monitor and 10 units Security IP Camera because the submitted quotation is
more responsive to the needs of the end user with added features.

WHEREAS, TWG recommended the awarding of 1 unit Document Scanner to
Compucare Center because the submitted quotation is more responsive to the
needs of the end user. While, the 1 unit Core i5 laptop was awarded to the lowest
responsive bidder which is 16/35 mm Production, Inc.

NOW, THEREFORE, We the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC),
hereby RESOLVE as it is hereby RESOLVED:

To award the following items to the bidder with the lowest calculated responsive bid:

10 units Security [P Camera

ITEMS BID AMOUNT SUPPLIER

1 unit Laptop, Core i5 or higher | Php 37,000.00 | 16/35mm Production Supply

1 unit Laptop, Core i7 or higher 69,680.00 | iEquity Technologies, Corp.

4 units Desktop 235,200.00 | iEquity Technologies, Corp.

1 unit LCD Projector 23,680.00 | jEquity Technologies, Corp.

1 unit Document Scanner © 43,295.00 | Compucare Center

f/l gg::cs)r%” UHD 4K Flat Smart 210.600.00 | IEquity Technologies, Corp.
34.000.00 | IEquity Technologies, Corp.

DOST Complex, Gen. Santos Ave.
Bicutan, Taguig City
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. ’ Republic of the Philippines
Department of Science and Technology
' SCIENCE AND TECHNOLOGY INFORMATION INSTITUTE

RESOLVED, at the STII Training Room, this 23" day of October 2017.

BENEDICT P76

AGAANAN

Chair, Bids and Awd ommittee@AC)
ARLE TENO ALAN C. ﬁféé“’
BA e-Ghair BAC Member
JAQUELINE\C,/ BALLESTEROS MARIEVIC ARQUITA
BAC Member BAC Member

Director, HoPE
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